2016 ¥ fIgs weais 12

fearae yew g™ w1 (Wewl @ w9 sk d=m)
woteq fagas, 2016

(faem= wr % grwnfia g #)



faomae wew Rur @ (@l & A 3R 992E)
wutes faeas, 2016

QUEl &1 HmH

i

o> O RN =

@ ~N

wféret |

. GRT 3 BT GO |

. SIIRT 4 T HEEA |

. URT 4T & | |
. U7 4-S & G |
. gRT 6 &1 FIET |

. R 6—% BT GAT |
. YRT 6—@ &1 QA |



10

15

‘ 2016 &1 fAdgs T=iF 12

mmmﬁwmaﬁamm)
wme f¥as, 2016

(Rerrern # gevenfia vy #)

fearae fum w1 (Fewf @ ww ok o) afdfigm, 1971
(1971 &1 AfRfrTm Femis 8) #1 AR HARE B @ R |

ARG TURSY @ Hewod 9§ ¥ fRume wew fAum W gr
f=fofaa vu 4 a8 sfRfafa -

1. 59 AR o1 e Tn e wow R v (Gedl wRa
@ Wl R UE) warE s, 2016 ¥ ik

2. fR¥Teel yew Ry w1 (Hew @ vy ok Yo affas, a3
1971 (¥ 50 590 Uve] et Rraw oer T 8) o a3 A T |
SR (1) 4, 9 TOR” TR SR W U9y g9R” T
ST |

3. et fRfam B a7 4 B I (1) B @ws (i) F, vH w4 @
BUR Ui Wl” v @ WE W UH 6N a8 6 e W we
TG |

4. o IRFTH H aRr 4w FH— aRT 4-W

T HYE |

(@) “9WI8 TR WK B WH W® TN R’ TR @

S

(@) STERT (2) #, “TW FAR” YR @ WH ® 9 gur

mvﬁmﬁlsﬁv

(M) SR (3) ¥ “INE FART R P W W “GEE
BU ¥&G YW G0 |



2

ORI 4-F 5. W0 IRFEH B ON 4-F H SWR () F WH W

Lol i

i mmwmm
“(2) v qagd wew, e e o sl @t gfler g
F 2 IR W afm A vt T B Sw W A Wl
yfreera o fan 2, fda g fmfor aftm & gl wa FA
& frg, Wiy o wowu Y eemifd, Uit ol @ e,
XA 3 Pt 78 Fmfor @1 99 910 78 @1 BT IR B Y
I R FHE P RHT P B fag F¢ MG FEE g
IR P Y, I A HT §haR arn ||

4R 6 BT 6. iﬂaﬂﬁﬂﬂiﬁﬂmsﬁ.—
g |
(@) SwmT (1) R B wege ¥ ] 9T TRl @ W
W T A U FORC U ¥ W | AR

(@) SR (1-%) ¥, “T6 TN &l » ®F R “v=dE
TR Y T WIE |

:;“5—’5 7. ¥ IR B 9N 6-3 ¥, TH dE” TRl @ X
vy O 'Wmmm'mwmm

aRT 6~ 8. 7ol fdfraw & U 6@ H-
:I!ﬁ'em
(@) SR (1) ¥ “IEW’ T P W R “ASIEE” TR
X@T T ; 3R

(@) STERT (1) @ WoF e 4, “uiE 6l 9@ P WA W®
“TF TR TR @ TG |

10

15

20



I vdl 3R RO BT U

mmmmmw,mmmwammﬁmm
& w9 3 e oew B R T S RO ST IR T & F 9 o & AR
ST e STeRmE AR G-l ¥ W B aaR G Y8 8 AR e w6
ﬁg@—gﬁmaﬁﬁﬁmmﬁmw$mﬂ$m,qﬁﬁmmm
¥ R T @ ff ey 91 2 | gafery, waw gE-gfer Wil @ Rwie o
Waﬂ%mm?ﬁmaﬁwmo/—mﬁwss,ooo/-mﬁﬁﬂmmﬁ.
%ﬁmmﬁ1m/—m%am1m/—wgﬁﬁﬂm,ﬁahﬂmmaﬁ
eo,om/—m%mgo,om/—maﬂﬁ,wm’raam—aﬁm,m/—m@amaﬂ
w,om/-wuﬁmm,mqa/mﬁﬂaﬁwmﬁ12,000/—mﬁa3m
15mo/—muﬁﬁmmﬁmﬁﬁﬁu%mw?|mm,gwm(ﬁ;im)
gﬁm%mmmﬁﬂwﬁ@%ﬁmmmﬁzmmo/—mﬁw
z,so,ooo/—maﬂ'lvuma:ﬁnas‘no,ooo/—mﬁamzs,ooo/—maﬂﬁﬁwﬂ
ffreera fra a1 & | qEd—wawl A g9 4, o A (Y Fifre) e & SR ST
mﬁaﬁnﬁ‘lﬁ’fa"mmm1,oo,ooo/—w$mm1,25,ooo/—ws’l1ﬁ|3ﬂ$
mﬁﬁmW—Waﬁﬁmaﬁn,m/—muﬁwﬁmzamo/—mnﬁmm
) 3l g FEEE 3 o @ afiRa Fs o @ forg fdfRa e 1 500/~ BT
@taaraw'wm/—uﬁwaﬂﬁm%ﬁﬁﬁmi%mw%waﬁmﬁm v four
w(ﬂma%qﬁsﬂvﬁm)a@ﬁmwnﬁﬁmfmmﬁmawﬁl

7% fdue Iuda weawl o I & faw ¥ |

(e RiE)
a7 |



facha su=

’

A @ @Ue 2 A 8 @ IRFEEE B w yiiad T 13.76 HRIS WIY B
R amadt &g 8 |

A @ GRET @ agwT 207 @ I woaua B RwRe
(@Rer i Shovodio—A— (&)-5—1/2016)

RaTae TN B WS, Rurge vow R W (Fewl @ w iR ) BRI
ﬁaw,m1eﬁﬁw—m$mﬁqﬁﬁmmﬁ$m,m$vﬁw#$m
207 B o, Rdgs @ Uog RuE T § R BRI 98 W R e B

Ry v & |



Ruraa vy fRum w (wewl @ A ok ) e Rdue, 2016

fRrae e fRum | (Wewl @ 9o iR U=ere) afdfaam, 1971 (1971 @1 gy
HeEi® 8) o1 AR WO & @ forg RYgas |

(@rme Riw)
& "7 |




Tu Wygy fdde g1 W wifda @9 ard Raee wew RuaE aen
(et @ wa 3k M) afifEw, 1971 (1971 @ SRR W=miE 8 ) @
I B I
ETRI:

3. A= A FfPuTE w— T awfde wal & N @A g e
e 31 39 PRE @ ygw 89 @ aRiE W 1 SH A IR aftfiam, 1951 B
e wRre Wy @ Faifa o e o & ode & o ol &= dvon R 89

g A E B, ) RiF B B adE ¥, 37 9 A ¥ o N A # 8, vy g e geR
WIU P TX F A7 AR IE TR BIQ B X F HASISTS A Haed (bal QA |

@) XXX XXX XXX XXX
@) XXX XXX XXX XXX

(@) o SR qd i el @ B 8 g A, e wew & e U ey
3 TR ¥, R IR 78 aong wge ) R & i RAfe e & o, &1 da= 3R
TGS Wl e Tel fbdr Wy |

e~ 3H Yo @ fore e ARy & amrfa 5 Fars FRw |
wafxra R & anfs iRy 61 &

4. AT A~ (1) OO wal AR Gl B opfie v gy, o gw AlfEw B
el T U PRl g1 ARRINE @Y oy, YRe wew @ Haw fdhar Sgm—

@) Y amn wwn o Rk fear

(i) o oRfY @ afdvE F suReT e ¥ we RT3 R o semE B
AT e P WU B AUR Fodl 9 R A off we W A 3= e
& forg Y 7 gl @ R ¥ yfafke @ ok uiw ) wuy @ &% 9§ faRw W

] Al Rl e @) awd yge R vew R @ ik ok e
e Fram @ ol i @ A a1 AT | arguer e @ forg s fobar
¥ 7E Rl P Y el & fT YT e WK B PN EBEAR TE BT



WY TF AR & v

(@) wtef a8 |91 & AT ¥ SuRerm B @ forg W IfTE Y aRE @ T
77 < fo o v &, T O AftRYE @ Wi @, 99 A 9, R '
aff¥ea Bra o g ex @ il 8, e ve a1 &1 R geEm R ERl
2 g, guRefy, gges ok M o 3 W e A w1 RE @ o el

(@) orel a8 e Wiy & afdem % suRem 89 & fog (9 aftRes & o
A & 2 gf uguan &, 1 W ARReE @ wre § 3 ke A e 3
e TP = gvEn TR BRal €, 98 TgEn R TRIE & @ W@ @ A
& forg;

favm WY BT sHER W BT |

(iii) 519 B e v P 3 TiE wre @ afEeE § sufd B8R @ fag
ORI PRl & 3R ARIYE @ vvEq g8 aud eledr 8, 79 e @ A @ wiide wrH
J e @ e @ Ry aie $ug Y o= | e e ok wiie e W vges @ R
3 R oig TUT P R A IS HRY BT FHEAR B |

W —(1) —5w B U TEE A1 () T B IS R @ g e
P BN, AR UgEH 3R IR B WY 9 W B |

B (2) 1 1 WA B D arpplie afdeEl @ 99 wR RT 4 Bn
1 o W e @ g o U R @ S O ity @ W W YR A8) el
2, Suferfy &1 R\ o1 & fR= wwer =g

g ¥ R @ IS 9 R W F A A a1 e R @1 §deR T8
T, Il S e o9 wE ¥, o ) S SuRfy W wew @ w9 § 9SS Fwial
> e ¥ iR 2, ow A9 @ R B i ® g e a1 SRaR Syar
g |

) < wew yRfRT U& TR Uig W WUY A R W - S & 9 aw
(1) % SuafRra 8, €l o 9TEaT B, 98 25 TEa9, 1971 W FHE w1 & fged 9% axie
R farg &) e aaf @ for wfifes u=ie Uy &Y oX ¥ 9@ @ §BaR 81T iR T
T A Su-ur (1) B @Wog (2) AR (3) B SUSH TR & B |



. wsAHr— (1).— $9 SU-UN & YA @ fog e W Fary @ o, § 9w
araf i & Rred e o8 v W W W OTEl |91 37 At a1 wify o d5
Bt B 71 e U O D WY F IS P A TR Pig 1 Br—brol a1 S
2 0 Afdem o1 Yo% ¥ SuRYT B9 @ WA @ o ar N o e R B
T @ fare fams s 2, iR 399 aaiid o9 el @ Aol @ fHarg o 3 i
W fam FRaT & e 9 31 JfAeE a1 |9y Y Yoo Bt ® a1 Ofel 99 w9 A 9ue
P § RN PIE I PH-B [BaT AT & —

(1) w1 @ e & g ¥ ARTRE T IR ¥ G @ A @7 9 e
F Y Frarg o 2 3k 59 @ I, R w1 @ A fReaee @ fog o w@ =
X o & o @ fore wfira faar S @, S Swvad! O R 9 o fds 9 ¥ s
ﬁiﬂ'ﬂﬁ;@'\’

2) affy B Yoo a1 fFe ag Tw—aro @ g # WY B BE-B A XY
F-are @ TRW W e g o) R ¥ e A o frarw & o R wfifa @
FH—PTA AT 3G PH—PIG & FAG 8 ¥ S ggar] & T | omids & W Farw
o Ay | '

WL (2) W B o R A @ oy v few @ fog 2Fe s
e B, TR UgEd AR TR @1 96 g W @ |

4. Pafes 8=, srafaa sl sgex /e = e Jw@n—(1)
TP W B WS E9R HUT Ufdmr Y ex ¥ frafas &= v W dea fHar s |

) YIS WE P TH TAR WY P IR § PTG Wl HWewa fbar e | -

(3) TR e B, DI—eliTH AR TR FHYEY /T Tt ATRER 78 8] INE
AR WY UM @) o) A e fhar S |

4—=— wagd weat B e fmin afm—(1) W g we 3, R
W @ w9 ¥ 8 Pt afdm Y gl gre 78 21 2, 7 fetr @ g @ . 51
B F9 B D fog, W At B o, IR 3 e s9g MU FAEt g seRa @
WY, SRR ofim & w9 3 i arE Uy Hew Ry S AR 7' e genfefy, Se!
Yere a1 aiRaR® YvH § urg aut & fiR agd far s |



@) vS Hew, R Su-awT (1) 3 ol e Fmfor aiflm A gfen wa &
2 3l R w1 wwged W 7, 9 W T Wik, v @R R 8, fde s A
afim ot gl s @ @ forg, ftreda afdrrerey Y aeifdl, 0 ol @ oz, Sl
=9 s 7z Fmfor a1 o9 a91¢ e @1 wa v & forg g T Pl g s 2
Y, T X B EHaR el | :

6— Y@ ERT W g W gNT 41 WS UREEd SUHA g1 fIyes
AL~ (1) TS Hew JU gerafy & ARE AU g D Y A1 T B AR FHD
T 1 e & g 6 Wi g weA A 5 afea 3w el off e e
& Soft % X1 wrf o arg At a1 o9 oRess Suew gRT 3w @ AR I1 AR A0 B
&1 EPeR BN 3R 98, Te Rchy o ¥ sfem < o/ w9 @ s, §9 9BR
ST arfad 2 1 ulgf F gwer, W @ 7E A A Rdel B uwgd I W,
g |

W] WE O WRHT WA W8 A 98 aigAnf a1 Yomnt ar e aRaed g
T B ERH IS HgH FNT I IHS! @IS AR FEIA $ D foIQ S | A=
FY arel fored o =afy gy Y TE T # SWIa arfdd oy $ ufagfd #1 ghar,
T TS A P TPl B UK DI U BT ¢

Ry 7% AR b Yot a1 agert a1 Ao 9Rasw g B T A @ g Wy
Fo @ ficfy af 4 @ o wav | afe T8 Bl |

WAL~ §H SU-URT B S @ fog ug “gggEa ¥ 9y @ ol @ 9
Ifdafed g3 3R g (g3 afnra e qen sfarfea Te g 3R g A gwe e
g |

(1—m)mm,mmmw,mﬁm$mmmm%
I AT BT §HaR T AR T Haw A fach of & i & g wErifsa
frar s, T BN W Ol o Swe dm ol A 9 veHwa I § ey R
|



WS~ T URT P e, T BH BT IquRY FI @ g #f=2i & a4
AR wan (Bwrae wew) aifRfaas, 2000 @ a7 7 A1 Raee g3w fRum war arme R
JurezE I AR, 1971 B ORT 10-F B 3 S Ry af F Yemnt @ arg Awf
ERT & 77E U131 ¥ §H YR SUTd EH 31 fFaE # oy s |

(1—a) 2 Py IR IR U= fHT ST O 3! 3R IS T IT SHB!
G-I AR TErIar 3 oy Sue 9 I HRA arl D oy afd & Y oft v
femrae wew v yRae A & & st Jar a9 # fawran ok 99 R @ ot &R &1
Way oy fa=r amEr s &1 gheR a9 |

(2) Su—um (1) & el Wl B TR B TE FHUA KD AR YD a3/
yemafy @ forv Rt ght &k W) 3l @ sgum W) 7 99D gR1 SfE, fRAred ey
fou 1 o1 arafifa ax Ry Se |

(3) 39 a1 B fEet ara o1 v aief FE e Sy R ¥ @8 wew R i
A A &1 &per 9 @ foraer g8 =g 39 AR gw a1 gagfls e9v v FaE @
TugHf B N ghER B

6—®. qAYd W B ¥A GRT IT YA g Herar oy IRaEd 9usH
T U g (W gifve) gien— ude gd e 3 a9 §gd @ Wiy 91 I
B IR IS QAT T HERAT FRA B O IHD W ATA DY a1t iy Al @
w1y faret o wwa fedt A Aot # Y@ At g o ag ARt g A vy wRase susd g
HRE % AR T FA F THER 811 AR 98, T Ay ad § gfiepad 1@ org Hag
% I, 6 THR ST aafde g @ ufgff @ swar, TN A wE g @Y e
B URIA PR W B

ey R of # Yemrt g ar argart g die 9Rass Sumd g1 A TS A
@ forg weT go ¥u e A B¢ | e g e |

-4 U — (1) yde &y @, Rre—

(%) fear w91 & wew, 1



(@) &g gRwg wewy, o
) qrTe: e e @ wew ok Anra: g uReg @ wewy, ar

(=) (1)wf%araram@daﬁﬂwwﬁ%mwmaﬁﬁmw;m
(2) icwHTeNA UoTd XToy BI faEE I, A

(3) aeBreiE dua Woa B REr W, A

(&) WP U AR T 3R @ e f oo grten ftifE, 1966 Bt
a1 5 @ o RArae wRe 3 W Ty g & a1 S A @ afaffee
T @ forg Fraffia o amfée oo 2,

®) T T W B wew AR ArTe:, aurRefy, gfearen R gdi geie
o 8 B AT X9 T THTEA U I B R W B A
w9 ¥ uim 7§ 7@ R o @ forg War 2 R, v a1gw g9R w¢
Y= HEw B A

maﬁﬁsﬁmﬁﬁ#mmﬁmm$m%mﬁﬁmaﬂa
TE T T A A e aafly @ ue ad @ fry uim W wuu  wfeEr @ srfaRe
S wiew 2 e | 56 v @ forg 9 @ e Wi @ v o @ Wy # | fsar
SITQETT -

T T AR 5 T g B anfie W fRa e @ s wv @ o
Sl B O B HE, R & (e &) A warfaee frafes &= & Fratf
Tl @ gun ¥, wei Pates o gerg @ e fraa Re @ wweEma’ e @ 7 e
A & T ATy o wS, 9 andia, Rier e g # R v & fag Rl sew
21 T Rred W # ol a8 A e, Rwaia (e &) 3§ Faffia wewl 7
s e o 8, @ wemadi oy @ A wor @ Se |



wWPr— U5 “Reaida &% (rewey &) A =R R aEle td Rodl o
aer g Rven ¥ aede gl iR wRER fld 2 |

(2) <T&1 S9-uRT (1) B N =T P TFAR P Af—

() <oy o1 Su—xrsufy @ g8 @ foy freifaa Rear smar @ ar fedt wow &
T A1 Y WY Uwy &3 B YUNS @ U W fgan far o 8 4

(i) i wrow @ W wow & @Y fau wn ar B ww o fRur oRvg @
faceht weee SRR, 1966 (1966 BT 19) B 9T (3) B i T fReelr weTR uReg
&1 GEW 99 O B Al

(iil) ¥ R BT AR 1 e T50 TR D IR U1 Brd TRpwal e
I TRBR B i a1 ool e fm § a1 e mivewor § fHafea o
I TRBR, Fr a7 I miteRer | o B8 TRHAfAE U BT gFeR 8 o §;
3 e aafa A o B Ry Rrad ag YaT g ey ey e & a1 Y1 wew &4 WE
2 o1 W AR & o1 W TReE $1 §PeR 91 Bl &, IR (1) B FefE 4=
U™ P PSR Tl BAI

R STEl Y @fd W Ug gRY B 7 ¥ e e A1 W i e @
e w2 daw a1 wE W @l B wea wvs (jii) ¥ fiffe aRefe B & A
IU-4RT (1) B ol I Wy UewrE A B9 B, 7% V1 A W IU-4RT B I Y=
B T ¥ Bae AT BT U FE BT EHIAR &

(3) W&t Su-u (1) @ i TR U T EHER BIE e I U 9 B A
s@er & a8 O @i, VR o U B WYY SU-¢RT (1) & A, I 9T A
HT FPAR BN |

(@) Su-urr (1) 3 weE @ fag ast # wEn EoE s A 99 qaf o A
1o ) TG R SR e afd 3wl @ dae o aat (Bwmae wev) sfefiam,
1971 (1971 1 FRFEA wRei® 3) § ayn wRaifa # @ ww A a1 Rar T & sege A
SUhE U7 WY W90 &N D IAH D ©T A AT BT 7 |



(5) 81 JU—em=T (1) B N I AT VR OF B FHAR Afdd B TG B TN
& a =

() Swh o/ ufy e ofies s § ar gl odw ; O

(i) afe W =fd & o /ofy 98 & O avear A oY AT R gde
SHS! wH AR g B < # I fars v, W afda @ g ey
U B 60 MfwT B TR W URE o B FHER BA:

R el 39 SU-URT @ oHE Ue ¥ afdE afe 4R o @ gher 8 o &
w4 aufdd SaT URH BT FHH 9§ oF B FHAN BAT |

(5—3) 3 a7 ¥ el A @ wiiee B 8y ofY, el B8 Al Iu-arT (1) =@
SU-GRT (1-31) B INT I=E o BT QR 8 747 8w, g HRA<, 1989 & Wd fa
¥ gd SHS T B 9 P PR a8 W IR TE o Gl qwi SwS g, ufY, raues
war a1 sfdarfEa gl Su-uwt (5) @ arfi Ue o @l s@eR BN, AT 6 Y s
HRAR) 1989 D ARG R By ofifaa o |

(6) 3% w1 ¥ el AT & Wi BXY Y N oTET P Al ST (1) B awhe
TH o @1 §®aR B T s, faeg Ry, 1976 @ gwiad Re ¥ gd Swat 99w
TN P BRYT I8 U UM FE o G, G-

(i) <P i w1 # a1 WS Y7 A w i SwaT ufy /ueh, ar

(ii) ﬁ@%ﬂﬁ/ﬁﬂﬁ%ﬂ%ﬂaﬁmwmaﬁm
W @9 T4 AR gt A g ¥ S flae e 1w,

T R @ R U O O @fde | 09 @ wu # giw & B, af? a8 fRuww, 1978
@ gRIGd a7 & ofae Brar 7 & 9 qaEey v & Al ufy A, 3 e A ¥ o
fer B, T BT EHIR B/ B

TR ¥ SU-ERT B I A W vETR WY @) Soeew € S, 1986
dAidrd fa @ w1, 1988 @ IR R 7% oY Bromay B 9w @ g sy 8 Bef



] I8 AR & TEl 39 SU-uRT 3 ofE UF W A e 9 @ §FER @
W W T @ 59 9E B R B H e |

(7) vd® Il P A T IR D A IR/ H U ol & 1 UL / FgE
Fe o BT EPER B, AT U/ Fow UM B Ao, SR ) ¥ 4 W HEE
& Haw @ A G U WWHR B F IR AR B Agea B |



AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

BILL NO. 12 OF 2016

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES
AND PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2016

(As INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)



THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

Clauses:

O IR OY Bl 18 O e

(ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2016

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Short title.

Amendment of section 3.
Amendment of section 4.
‘Amendment of section 4-B.
Amendment of section 4-E.
Amendment in section 6.
Amendment of section 6-A.
Amendment of section 6-B.



10

15

Bill No. 12 of 2016

THE HIMACHALPRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2016
(ASINTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)

A
BILL

Sfurther to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in
the Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follow:-

1. This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly  short title.
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2016.

2. In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Amendment
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (hereinafter referredto °* **"** >
as the “principal Act”), in sub-section (1), for the words “thirty thousand”,
the words “fifty five thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Insection 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (ii), Afme":’,::';'
for the words “ome thousand five hundred”, the words “one thousand o moeaiss
eight hundred” shall be substituted.

4. Insection4-B of the principal Act,— Amendment

of section
(2) insub-section (1), for the words “sixty thousand”, the words *™
“ninety thousand” shall be substituted. ;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “ten thousand”, the words
“thirty thousand” shall be substituted. ; and

(¢) in sub-section (3), for the words “twelve thousand”, the
words “fifteen thousand” shall be substituted.



oﬂf'“;"cfz:nl 5. In section 4-E of the principal Act, for sub-section (2), the

4-E. following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(2) Each ex-member who has availed the facility of house building
advance and has repaid whole amount of such advance with interest
thereon, shall be entitled to avail facility of second house building
advance by way of repayable advance, such sum of money, subject
to such conditions, as may be determined by rules made in this behalf,
for construction of house or for the purchase of built-up house or for

renovation of old house.”,
Am d . - . o
2 s:‘;“:l‘:‘ 6. Insection 6 of the principal Act,

(a) insub-section (1) and second proviso, for the words “two
lac”, the words “two lac fifty thousand” shall be
substituted. ; and

(b) insub-section (1-A), for the words “ten thousand”, the
words “twenty five thousand” shall be substituted.

. 7. In section 6-A of the principal Act, for the words “one lac
rupees”, the words “one lac twenty five thousand rupees” shall be
subsituted.

Amendment of 8. Insection 6-B of the principal Act,-

section 6-B.
(a) insub-section (1), for the figures and sign “22,000”, the
figures and sign “28,000” shall be substituted.; and

(b) inthe first proviso to sub-section (1), for the figures “500”,
the figures “1000” shall be substituted.

10

15

20



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to sharp increase in the cost of living and the considerable expenses which the Hon’ble
Members of the State Legislative Assembly as a public representative has to incur on account of
various demands of the public life, there has been persistent demand for the revision of their
existing emoluments and amenities and Vidhan Sabha Members Amenities Committee have also
recommended to enhance the salary, allowances and other perquisites of the Members of the H.P.
Legislative Assembly. As such, it has been decided to accept the recommendations of the Members
Amenities Committee and to enhance the salary of Members from Rs. 30,000/ to Rs. 55,000/-
per mensem, Daily Allowance from Rs. 1500/- to Rs. 1800/- per day, Constituency Allowance
From Rs. 60,000/~ to Rs. 90,000/, Office Allowance from Rs. 1 0,000/- to Rs. 30,000/- per
mensem, Computer/Data Entry Operator Allowance from Rs. 12,000/ to Rs. 1 5,000/- per
mensem. It has also been decided to enhance existing limit for reimbursement of: expenses incurred
on account of free transit facility from Rs. 2,00,000/- to Rs. 2,50,000/- and Travelling Advance
from Rs. 10,000/~ to Rs. 25,000/-. In case of ex-members, now the limit for reimbursement of
expenses incurred on account of free transit facility shall be Rs. 1 ,25,000/- instead of
Rs. 1,00,000/-. It has further been decided to enhance the Pension to ex-member from Rs.
22,000/~ to Rs. 28,000/~ per mensem and additional pension from Rs. 500/- to Rs. 1000/~ per
mensem for every year in excess of the period of first term. This has necessitated the amendments
in the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971,

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(VIRBHADRA SINGH),
Chief Minister.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Clauses 2 to 8 of the Bill, when enacted, will entail additional recurring expenditure
out of the State Exchequer to the tune of Rs. 13.76 crore per annum approximately.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 OF THE
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

(File No. GAD-C (D)-5-1/2016)

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill,
2016, recommends, under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and consideration
of the Bill in the State Legislative Assembly.



THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES
AND PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2016

A
BILL
further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension
of Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).

(VIRBHADRA SINGH)
Chief Minister.

(DR. BALDEV SINGH)
Pr. Secretary (Law).



EXTRACT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE
ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS) ACT, 1971 (ACT NO.
8 OF1971) LIKELY TO BEAFFECTED BY THIS AMENDMENT BILL

Sections:

3 Salaries and Compensatory Allowances.- (1) Subject to the condition herein
contained, there shall be paid to each Member a salary at the rate of thirty thousand rupees and
compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand per mensem with effect from the
commencement of this Act or from the date on which he is declared duly elected under the
Representation of the People Act, 1951(Act No. 43 of 1951), or if such declaration is made
before the vacancy occurs, from the date of occurrence of vacancy which is later.

(PATEEED 6:0.0.0.6.0.0.0.0.9.0.0.0.9.0.9,0.0.0.0.0,0,4
(E)ID 9.9.9.9.0,0.9.0.0.0.0.9.0.0,0.0.0.6.0..0,0,¢

(4)  Notwithstanding anything hereinbefore contained no salary and compensatory
allowance shall be paid to any member in respect of any period during which he was under legal
detention under any law for the time being in force.

Explanation.-- The legal detention for this purpose does not include detention under any
law relating to preventive detention.

4. Travelling Allowances.— (1) subject to conditions and limitations as may be imposed
by rules made under this Act, there shall be paid to each member,--

@) such travelling allowance as may be prescribed,;

(i) a halting allowance at the rate of one thousand five nudered rupees per day for
each day of attendance at a meeting of the Assembly, or committee or in respect of journeys
undertake under the orders of the Speaker for any other business anywhere connected with his
duties as amember:

Provided that if amember has been ordered to absent himself from a meeting or meetings
of the Assembly under the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Himachal Pradesh
Assembly for the time being in force, he shall not be entitled to get allowance for such period of
absence:

”,



Provided further that a member shall also entitled to halting allowance,-

(a) where he arrives for attending a meeting of Assembly one or two dates earlier to
the date on such meeting, or departs from the place of such meeting one or two days immediately
after the date on which the Assembly is adjourning sine die for such one or two days, as the case
may be, of arrival and departure; and

(b)  where he arrives for attending a meeting of a committee one day earlier to the date
of such meeting or departs from the place of such meeting one day immediately after the conclusion
of the business of the Committee, for such one day of arrival and departure;

(iii) Anincidental allowance at the rate of five rupees for the day of departure from and an
incidental allowance at the rate of five rupees for the day of arrival at the usual place of residence
of the member when he leaves his usual place of residence to attend a meeting and returns thereto
after the meeting.

Explanation-I.-- Halting allowance shall be admissible to a member for each day of such
arrival and such departure irrespective of the time of arrival and departure.

Explanation-11.-- A break of less than four days between two successive meetings of the
Assembly or Committee shall be deemed to be a day or days of attendance for a member, who
does not leave the place of the meeting during such break:

Provided that nothing in this section shall entitle any member to travelling allowance if such
person ordinarily resides or carries on business at any place within eight kilometres of the place at
which his attendance is required in connection with his duties as member.

(2) A member who does not wish to draw the halting allowance at the rate of one
thousand per day as provided in sub-section (1), shall be entitled an allowance at rate of twenty-
five rupees for each day during any period residence on duty from the 25th day of January, 1971,
till the dissolution of the existing Assembly and in such case the provisions of clauses (ii) and (iii) of
sub-section shall not apply.

Explanation-I— For this purpose of this sub-section “period of residence on duty” means
the period during which a member resides at a place where a session of the Assembly or a sitting
of the Committee is held or where any other business connected with his duties as such member is
transacted, for the purpose of attending such session or sitting or for the purpose of attending to
such other business, and includes, except in the case of a member who ordinarily resides at a place



where a session of the Assembly or a sitting of the Committee is held or where any other business
connected with his duties as such s transacted-

) in case of a session of the Assembly, a period of such residence, not exceeding
three days immediately preceding the commencement of the session and a period of such residence,
not exceeding three days, immediately succeeding the date on which the Assembly is adjourned
sine die or for a period exceeding seven days; and

(ii) in the case of a Committee or any other business, a period of such residence, not
exceeding two days immediately preceding the commencement of the business of the Committee
or other business and a period of such residence, not exceeding two days, immediately succeeding
the conclusion of the business of the Committee or other business.

Explanation-11.- Daily allowance shall be admissible to a member for each day of
residence on duty irrespective of the time of arrival and departure.

4-B. Constituency, Office and Computer/Data Entry Operator allowance.— (1)
There shall be paid to each member a constituency allowance at the rate of sixty thousand rupees
per mensem. '

(2) There shall be paid to each member an ofﬁce allowance at the rate of ten thousand
per mensem.

(3) There shall be paid to each member an allowance at the rate of twelve thousand
rupees per mensem to engage Computer/Data Engry Operator on co-terminus basis.

4-E. House building advance to ex-members.-- (1) There may be paid to such ex-
members, who have not availed the facility of house building advance as a member, by way of
repayable advance, such sum of money, subject to such conditions, as may be determined by rules
made in this behalf for the construction of a house or for the purchase of a built up house.

(2) Each ex-member, who has availed the facility of house building advance under sub-
section (1) and has repaid whole amount of such advance with interest thereon, shall be entitled 1o
avail facility of second house building advance, by way of repayable advance, such sum of money,
subject to such conditions, as may be determined by rules made in this behalf, for the construction
of house or for the purchase of built up house.

6. Free transit by railway or by air or by State Transport undertaking.- (1) Each
Member during the term of his office shall be entitled to travel at any time by railway or by air or



il

by State transport Undertaking by any class within or outside the country alongwith his family or
any person accompanying him to look after and assist him during travel and shall be entitled for the
reimbursement of actual expenses so incurred on production of tickets of such journey performed,
subject to maximum of two lac rupees in each financial year.

XXXXXXX
XXXXXXX
XXXXXXX

Provided further that the member while on official tour shall also be entitled for the
reimbursement of actual expenses so incurred by his (family) or any other person accompanying
him to look after and assist him during travel by air or by rail or by public transport on production
of tickets for such journey performed:

Provided further that the aggregate amount payable for the journey performed by railway
or by air (or by public transport) in a financial year shall not exceed two lac rupees.

Explanation- For the purpose of this sub-section, expression “family” shall mean the
spouse their unmarried son(s) and daughter(s) including unmarried adopted son and daughter.

(1-A) Each Member shall be entitled for an advance not exceeding rupees ten thousand
on his request to undertake such journey and the advance so paid shall be adjusted before the
closing of financial year, failing which the entire advance shall be recovered from his salary and
allowances in lump-sum.

Explanation- For determining the aggregate amount so incurred on such journey under
this section, the amount so incurred in the same financial year by journey performed by railway or
air under section 7 of the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000, or
under section 10-A of Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s
Salaries Act, 1971 shall be taken into account.

~ (1-B) Each Member shall be provided with two free non-transferable passes which shall
entitle him and his wife or any other person accompanying him to look after and assist him to travel
atany time without payment or fare and passenger tax thereon by any public vehicle of the Himachal
Road Transport Corporation.

(2) “(XXXXXX) free passes issued to amember under sub-section (1) shall be valid for
the terms of his office and on the expiration of such term these shall be surrendered by him to the
Secretary of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly.



(3) Nothing in this section shall be construed as disentitling a member to any travelling

allowance to which he otherwise entitled under the provisions of this Act or rules made there
under.

6-A. Free transit facility by railway or by air or by State Transport Under taking
to ex-members- Each ex-member shall be entitled to travel at any time by railway or by air or by
State Transport Undertaking by any class within India alongwith his spouse Or any person
accompanying him to lookafter and assist him during travel and shall be entitled for the reimbursement
of actual expenses so incurred on production of tickets of such journey performed, subject to
maximum of one lac rupees in each financial year:

Provided that the aggregate amount payable for the journey performed by railway or by
air or by State Transport Undertaking in a financial year shall not exceed one lac rupees.

6-B Pension.~(1) There shall be paid a pension of Rs.22,000 per mensem to every
person who has served for any period up to five years as,--

(a) amember of Assembly; or
(b) amember ofthe Territorial Council; or

(c) partlyasamember of the Assembly and partly as member of the Territorial Council:
or

(d) amemberof—

() the Legislative Assembly of the erstwhile State of Patiala and east Punjab States
Union; or '

(i) the Legislative Assembly of the erstwhile Punjab State; or

(i) the Legislative Council of the erstwhile Punjab State; or

(iv) partly asa member of the one and partly as a member of the other;

who has been elected or nominated to represent the whole or the part of the areas added to
Himachal Pradesh under section 5 of the Punjab re-organization Act, 1966.

[XXXXX]

(e) partlyasamemberofthe Assembly and partly asa member of the Legislative Assembly
of erstwhile State of Patiala and East Punjab State Union or the Legislative Assembly/ Council of
the erstwhile State of Punjab, as the case may be:



Provided that where any person has served as aforesaid fora period exceeding first term,
there shall be paid to him an additional pension of Rs. 500/- per mensem for every year in excess
of period of the first term, provided that for this purpose, the fraction of a year shall be counted as’
one year:

Provided further that while reckoning the period for the determination of the additional
pension payable under the preceding proviso in the case of members elected from the constituencies
comprised of Snow-bound area (non-Synchronous area) where the eléctions are or may be
conducted on any day subsequent to the day fixed for the general elections, the period intervening
the date on which the oath is administered to the members elected to the Assembly in the general
elections and the date on which the oath is administered to the members elected from the Snow-
bound area (non-Synchronous area) shall alsé be counted.

Explanation.— The expression “Snow bound area (non-Synchronous area)” means the
area comprising Kinnaur, Lahaul and Spiti district and Pangi and Bharmaur tehsils in Chamba
district.

(2) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1),-

() iselected to the office of the President or Vice-President or is appointed to the
Office of the Governor of any State or Administrator of any Union Territory; or

(i) becomesaMember of any Legislative Assembly ofa State ora Union Territory or
Legislative Council of State or the Metropolitan Council of Delhi constituted under section 3 of the
Delhi Administration Act, 1966; or

(i) isemployed ona salary under the Central Government or any State Government or
in a Corporation owned or controlled by the Central Government or any State Government or
local authority or becomes otherwise entitled to any remuneration from State Government,
Corporations or local authority;

such person shall not be entitled to any pension under sub-section (1) for the period during which
he continues to hold such office or as such member or is so employed or continues to be entitled
to such remuneration:

Provided that where the salary payable to such person for holding such office or
being such member or so employed or where the remuneration referred to in clause (iii) payable to
such person is in either case less than the pension payable to him under sub-section (1) such
person shall be entitled only to receive the balance as pension under that sub-section.



(3) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled to any
pension, such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under sub-section (1) in addition to
such other pension.

(4) Incomputing the number of years for the purposes of sub-section (1), the period
during which a person has served as a minister, as defined in the Salaries and Allowances of
Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 1971 or the Speaker or the Deputy Speaker of the Assembly
or the Chairman of the Territorial Council shall also be taken into account.

(5) Whereany person who draws pcns:on or is entitled to draw pension, under sub-
section (1), dies,-

(0  his/her spouse during his her life time or till he/she remarries; or

(i) .if such person leaves no spouse his minor children till they attain the age of majority
and in case of daughters till they get married;

shall be entitled to draw pension at the rate of 50% of pension as admissible to such person :

Provided that where more than one person becomes entitled for pension under this
sub-section all such persons shall draw the said pension in equal shares.

(5-A) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this section where a person
would have been entitled to draw pension under sub-section (1) or sub-section (1-A) of this
section but for his death before the 7* day of February, 1989 he could not draw such pension, his
spouse, minor children or un-married daughters shall be entitled to draw pension under sub-
section (5), as if such person was alive on the 7* day of February, 1989.

(6) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in this section, where a person
would have been entitled to draw pension, under sub-section (1) but for his death before the 31
day of December, 1976 he could not draw such pension—

(i) his/her spouse during his'her life time or till he/she remarries; or

(i) ifsuchaperson leaves no spouse, his’her minor children till they attain the age of
majority and in case of daughters till they get married;



shall be entitled to draw pension equal to a sum which would have been drawn by such a person
as pension under this section as if such person was alive on the 31* day of December, 1976 or the
sum of rupees three hundred and seventy five per mensem, whichever is higher:

Provided that the upper limit of rupees three hundred and seventy five shall not apply for
the pension under this sub-section for the period from the 24" day of January, 1986 to the 31 day
of March, 1988:

Provided further that where more than one person becomes entitled to pension under this
sub-section, all such persons shall draw the said pension in equal shares.

(7) Every person who draws pension/family pension or is entitled to draw pension/ family
pension, shall, in addition to the pension/family pension admissible under this section, be paid
dearness relief in pension at the same rates as is admissible to other pensioners of the State
Govemnment.

I geunerd, fRo vo, RMe-39—9S / 2016—6—4—2016—250.



